
ueorge Barber

George Thomas Barber,
born on Feb. 6, 1892 passed
away on Sept. 23, 1952, just
after being admitted to the
/ines hospital at . Berkeley
Springs, W. Va.

He was the son of the late
Amos and Mary Smith Bar- '
ber and was united in mar- :
riage to Miss Ethel Purnell,
who with their two sons Fred
erick and George Fay sur- i
Vive him as does a brother,

Francis Barber.

George was an industrious
farmer, living all his life in-

_the community near Sideling
Hill mountain, his home be
ing the Amos Palmer farm,
where they have built up to.
date farm buildings.

He was a member of the
.Needmore M. E. church and
was serving as trustee. He
also was trustee in the Plea
sant Grove cemetery associai
tion and a member of the
laymens fellowship and the!1
adult Sunday school class of .
Pleasant Grove. He was a,
member of the Needmore
Grange and a friend to many
people, and will be missed by
his family and friends.

Funeral services were con
ducted by Rev- T. P. Garland
assisted by Rev. Reginald Al-
ford and Needmore Grange,
also the choir from both the

Needmore and the Pleasant
Grove churches. The family
has the sympathy of the com
munity and their friends.


